

Allison, Bass & Magee, L.L.P.

402 W 12th Street

Austin, TX 78701

Phone: 512-482-0701 Fax: 512-480-0902

INVOICE

Date:06/07/2016

Invoice #: 1497

Matter: Caldwell County/ 130 Environmental Park

File #: 179.10

JUL 06 2016
COUNTY AUDITOR

Bill To:

Hon. Ken Schawe
Caldwell County
Caldwell County
110 S. Main
Lockhart, TX 78644

Due Date: 07/07/2016

Payments received after 06/13/2016 are not reflected in this statement.

Professional Services

Date	Details	Hours	Rate	Amount
01/01/2016	TAB Previous Invoice Balance, Invoice No. 13492.		\$4,006.04	\$4,006.04
01/06/2016	JEM Telephone Conference with: J. Powell concerning hearing before SOAH	0.30	\$240.00	\$72.00
01/06/2016	JEM Document Analysis: Correspondence from OPIC concerning agreement to move hearing dates because of Arten Avakien's availability.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/06/2016	JEM Document Analysis: Correspondence from B. Ryan concerning A. Tatu and A Avakian for hearing dates.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/06/2016	JEM Document Analysis: 130's Supplemental Response to Motion for Access to Site.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/06/2016	JEM Correspondence to: J. Powell concerning SOAH Hearing and potential revisions to schedule.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/07/2016	JEM Telephone Conference with: M. Perales concerning available dates for continued Hearing.	0.30	\$240.00	\$72.00
01/07/2016	JEM Correspondence to: B. Ryan concerning August 2016 hearing dates.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/07/2016	JEM Attend Hearing: SOAH concerning Motion to Compel, Motion for Site Access, Motion to Extend Discovery and Amended Procedural Schedule and Hearing Dates.	2.00	\$240.00	\$480.00

Allison, Bass & Magee, L.L.P.

402 W 12th Street

Austin, TX 78701

Phone: 512-482-0701 Fax: 512-480-0902

01/07/2016	JEM	Correspondence to: T. Bratton and J. Powell concerning changes in hearing date.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/07/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from J. Powell concerning conflicts on hearing dates.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/07/2016	JEM	Attend Hearing: SOAH Hearing concerning parties motions.	1.20	\$240.00	\$288.00
01/08/2016	PLL	Document Analysis: SOAH Order No. 10 scheduling evidentiary hearing and ruling on discovery motions.	0.20	\$210.00	\$42.00
01/08/2016	CAH	Reviewing Documents: Order No. 10 Dispositions on Motions and Rescheduling Hearing on the Merits.	0.30	\$100.00	\$30.00
01/08/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: and issue analysis: Hunter Tract Release and Indemnity.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/08/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Order No. 10- Dispositions on Motions and Rescheduling Hearing on the Merits.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/11/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from OPIC concerning Order No. 10.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/11/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC and TJFA's letter to SOAH concerning Order No. 10.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/11/2016	JEM	Correspondence to: M. Perales concerning Order No. 10 and Hearing Dates scheduled by SOAH.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/11/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from M. Perales concerning ALJs' Order No. 10.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/11/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from T. Bratton concerning Hearing.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/12/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC's Notice of Deposition of Ernest Kaufmann and Subpeona Duces Tecum.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/14/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: SOAH Order No. 11- Correcting Dates for Hearing on the Merits.	0.20	\$100.00	\$20.00
01/14/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Order No. 11 Correcting Dates for Hearing on the Merits.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/15/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC and TJFA's Deposition Notice of Biggs and Matthews.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/21/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Motion to Quash Deposition of BME	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/21/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Applicant's Motion to Require Split Samples of Material to be Tested and Request for Expedited Consideration/Hearing.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/22/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC and TJFA's Response to Motion to Split Samples of Material to be Tested and Request For Expedited Consideration/Hearing	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00

Allison, Bass & Magee, L.L.P.

402 W 12th Street

Austin, TX 78701

Phone: 512-482-0701 Fax: 512-480-0902

01/26/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: SOAH Order No. 12- Granting Motion to Require Split Samples.	0.40	\$100.00	\$40.00
01/26/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC's Request for Subpoena for Cathy Moore Hunter	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/26/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Order No.12- Granting Motion to Require Split Samples.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/28/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC and TJFA's Deposition Notice of S. Stamoulis.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/28/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC and TJFA's Deposition Notice of Kaufmann	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/29/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from B. Ryan concerning recent soil borings.	0.30	\$240.00	\$72.00
01/29/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: 130's Response to EPICC's Request to Subpeona C. Hunter.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/29/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC and TJFA's Second Amended Motion to Compel Access to Property.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/29/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC and TJFA's Deposition Notice of H.C. Clark.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
01/29/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from M. Perales concerning public hearing on dam.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/01/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: Order No. 13- Scheduling a Prehearing Conference and Granting Motion to Quash Deposition.	0.40	\$100.00	\$40.00
02/01/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC's Sixth Supplemental Disclosures.	0.30	\$240.00	\$72.00
02/01/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC's Fifth Supplemental Disclosure.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/01/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Order No. 13- Scheduling a Prehearing Conference & Granting Motion to Quash Deposition.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/02/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Applicant's Motion for Protective Order.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/02/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: 130's Response to TJFA's 1st Set of Discovery.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/02/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC and TJFA's Notice of deposition for K. Welch.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/02/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC and TJFA's Deposition Notice for depositions of B. Hodges and H. Parker.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/03/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: 130 Response to TJFA and EPICC's Second Amended Motion to Compel Site	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00

Allison, Bass & Magee, L.L.P.

402 W 12th Street

Austin, TX 78701

Phone: 512-482-0701 Fax: 512-480-0902

		Access.			
02/03/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: 130's Motion to Quash Depo of Clark.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/03/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: 130's Motion to Quash Kaufmann's deposition.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/03/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: 130's Motion to Quash deposition of Stamoulis	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/03/2016	JEM	Telephone Conference with: M. Perales concerning matter.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/04/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC's Request for Privilege Log.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/05/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC and TJFA's Notice of Deposition of M. Snyder.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/05/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC and TJFA's Reply to Applicant's Response to Request for Subpoena of Cathy Moore Hunter	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/05/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Applicant's January 28, 2016 and February 5, 2016 Supplemental Production.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/05/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Applicant's Motion to Quash Deposition of Heath Parker	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/05/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Applicant's Motion to Quash Deposition of William F. "Bill Hodges"	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/05/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Applicant's Motion to Quash Deposition of Kenneth Welch	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/05/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Applicant's Second Set of Interrogatories and Requests for Production to TJFA, L.P.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/05/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Applicant's Second Set of Interrogatories and Requests for Production to Aligned Parties	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/08/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: Applicant's January 28, 2016 and February 5, 2016 Supplemental Production.	0.40	\$100.00	\$40.00
02/08/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Cathy Moore Hunter's Response in Opposition to Protestant's Request for Second Deposition	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/08/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from M. Perales concerning changes in proposed scheduling order.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/08/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from M. Perales concerning hearing on motion to compel.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/09/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC's Motion to Compel	0.30	\$240.00	\$72.00

Allison, Bass & Magee, L.L.P.

402 W 12th Street

Austin, TX 78701

Phone: 512-482-0701 Fax: 512-480-0902

02/09/2016	JEM	Correspondence to: T. Bratton concerning matter.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/09/2016	JEM	Telephone Conference with: M. Perales concerning hearing.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/09/2016	JEM	Attend Hearing: SOAH Hearing concerning motion to compel.	1.30	\$240.00	\$312.00
02/10/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: 130's Amended Motion to Quash deposition of M. Snyder.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/11/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: and issue analysis: 130's 2nd Motion for Protective Order.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/11/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: 130's Response to TJCA Second Set of Discovery.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/12/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: SOAH Order No. 14.	0.40	\$100.00	\$40.00
02/12/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from OPIC concerning revised agreed order and procedural schedule	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/12/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC's Response to Motion to Quash Depositions of Kaufmann, Parker, Hodges and Welch.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/12/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC's Response to Motion to Quash Deposition of M. Snyder.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/12/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from B. Wilson concerning agreement with Site Access and Revised Schedule.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/12/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from B. Ryan concerning letter to ALJs concerning Site Access and amended Scheduling Order.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/12/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from B. Ryan concerning changes to proposed order.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/12/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from M. Perales concerning Proposed Agreed Order for Site Access.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/12/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from M. Perales concerning Proposed Penetration Locations.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/12/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from M. Perales concerning agreed order.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/16/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: B. Ryan to SOAH Administrative Law Judges re Field Work.	0.40	\$100.00	\$40.00
02/16/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: and issue analysis: 130's Response and Objections to TJFA and EPICC'S Depo Notice and Subpoena Duces Tecum of Biggs and Mathews Environmental.	0.30	\$240.00	\$72.00

Allison, Bass & Magee, L.L.P.

402 W 12th Street

Austin, TX 78701

Phone: 512-482-0701 Fax: 512-480-0902

02/16/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: TJFA's Request for Privilege Log.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/16/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from B. Ryan concerning field work.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/18/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC and TJFA's Brief on Timing for Ruling on Applicant's Second Motion for Protective Order.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/19/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: Rule 11 Agreement re Time and Location of Certain Depositions.	0.30	\$100.00	\$30.00
02/19/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC's Letter to ALJs concerning issues resolved for hearing.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/19/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Rule 11 Agreement between EPICC/TJFA and 130 Environmental Park concerning splitting samples.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/19/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: and issue analysis: 130's Supplemental Production and Response to TJFA RFP No. 7.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/19/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Correspondence from EPICC concerning Rule 11 Agreement Regarding Time and Location of Certain Depositions	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/22/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: Protestant's Proposed Order Granting Motion Compelling Site Access.	0.40	\$100.00	\$40.00
02/22/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: Applicant's Objections to Protestant's Proposed Order Granting Site Access and Adopting Procedural Schedule, or in the Alternative, Proffer Of Competing Proposed Order.	0.40	\$100.00	\$40.00
02/22/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: and issue analysis: 130's Objections to TJFA/EPICC's proposed order.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/22/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Proposed Order by Protestants' EPICC and TJFA.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/23/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: and issue analysis: 130's Request to Consider Objections.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/23/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: and issue analysis: 130's Correspondence to ALJs concerning proposed order.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/24/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: Order No. 15 Scheduling Prehearing Conference and Adopting Procedural Schedule.	0.40	\$100.00	\$40.00
02/24/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: and issue analysis: 130's Statement of Privilege.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/24/2016	JEM	Correspondence to: J. Powell concerning Hearing.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/24/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: Order No. 15 -Scheduling Prehearing Conference and Adopting Procedural	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00

Allison, Bass & Magee, L.L.P.

402 W 12th Street

Austin, TX 78701

Phone: 512-482-0701 Fax: 512-480-0902

Schedule.

02/26/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: Protestants' Relevancy Brief.	0.20	\$100.00	\$20.00
02/26/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: B. Ryan to ALJ Judges re Request to Consider Objections.	0.20	\$100.00	\$20.00
02/26/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: Applicant's Supplemental Response to TJFA, LP's Second Request for Production and Notice of Supplemental Production.	0.20	\$100.00	\$20.00
02/26/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: TJFA, LP and Environmental Protection in the Interest of Caldwell County's Motion to Compel Ernest C. Kaufmann to Answer Deposition Questions.	0.40	\$100.00	\$40.00
02/26/2016	JLS	Reviewing Documents: Notice of Appearance of Brad Rockwell.	0.20	\$100.00	\$20.00
02/26/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: and issue analysis: 130's Certificate of Conference from Request for Consideration of Objections.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/26/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: and issue analysis: 130's Supplemental Response to TJFA 2nd RFP	0.30	\$240.00	\$72.00
02/26/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC's and TJFA's Relevancy Brief.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/26/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC's and TJFA's Motion to Compel Kaufmann's deposition.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/26/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: EPICC's and TJFA's Notice of Appearance of Brad Rockwell.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/29/2016	PLL	Prepare for: deposition of Ernest Kaufmann.	0.50	\$210.00	\$105.00
02/29/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: and issue analysis: EPICC's Supplemental Brief concerning hearing.	0.30	\$240.00	\$72.00
02/29/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: and issue analysis: 130's Response to Motion to Compel Kaufmann Answers.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/29/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: and issue analysis: 130's Objection and Response to Depo Notice for Clark.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00
02/29/2016	JEM	Document Analysis: and issue analysis: 130's Objection and Response to Depo Notice for Stamoulis.	0.20	\$240.00	\$48.00

For professional services rendered

30.00

\$10,457.04

Additional Charges

Allison, Bass & Magee, L.L.P.

402 W 12th Street

Austin, TX 78701

Phone: 512-482-0701 Fax: 512-480-0902

Date	Details	Quantity	Rate	Amount
01/31/2016	TAB Printing and Reproduction of Documents	21	\$0.25	\$5.25
02/29/2016	TAB Printing and Reproduction of Documents	20	\$0.25	\$5.00

Total additional charges \$10.25

Invoice Amount \$10,467.29

Balance Due \$10,467.29

*K.M. → 7-7-16
6510 4110*