

**SMYSER KAPLAN & VESELKA, L.L.P.**

2300 Bank Of America Center  
700 Louisiana  
Houston, Texas 77002

Ph: (713) 221-2300      Fax: (713) 221-2320  
Tax ID #76-0458372

Harris County Emergency Services District  
c/o Myrtle Cruz, Inc.  
3401 Louisiana Street, Suite 400  
Houston, Texas 77002

Oct 31, 2017

Attention: Bill Russell

File #: 117001

Inv #: 28420

RE: Grand Jury Investigation by FBI

**David Isaak**

**Net 30 Days**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Initials</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hrs</b>	<b>Amount</b>
10/03/2017	DI	Prepare for and meet with board committee.	2.00	\$1,000.00
10/06/2017	DI	Call with [REDACTED].	0.30	\$150.00
10/12/2017	DI	No Charge - Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	N/C
10/13/2017	DI	Emails with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	\$50.00
10/16/2017	DI	Meet with [REDACTED]; review documents; discuss with [REDACTED].	1.70	\$850.00
	SLS	Attention to new matter; [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$67.50
10/17/2017	DI	Emails with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$250.00
	SLS	Attention to case documents; [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	2.40	\$540.00

10/18/2017	DI	Draft letter [REDACTED]	0.30	\$150.00
	SLS	Attention to email correspondence; respond to same.	0.20	\$45.00
10/19/2017	DI	Attend client board meeting; travel to same; emails with [REDACTED]	3.00	\$1,500.00
	SLS	Attention to [REDACTED]; attention to email correspondence; office conference [REDACTED]	1.20	\$270.00
10/20/2017	SLS	[REDACTED]	1.70	\$382.50
10/23/2017	DI	Email correspondence with [REDACTED]	0.10	\$50.00
10/26/2017	SLS	No Charge - Assemble documents for attorney review; [REDACTED]	1.00	N/C
10/27/2017	DI	Discuss [REDACTED] with [REDACTED]; email to [REDACTED]	0.40	\$200.00
	AMW	Conference with [REDACTED]	0.40	\$140.00
10/30/2017	AMW	[REDACTED]; correspondence with [REDACTED]	5.50	\$1,925.00
10/31/2017	DI	Discuss [REDACTED]	0.30	\$150.00
	AMW	Perform [REDACTED] review [REDACTED]; conference with [REDACTED]	2.40	\$840.00
	SLS	Begin to review documents [REDACTED]	1.00	\$225.00
		For Professional Services Rendered:	25.10	\$8,785.00

**File Summary:**

SKV Timekeeper	Hours	Effective Rate	Timekeeper Total
David Isaak	9.00	\$483.33	\$4,350.00
Alexander M. Wolf	8.30	\$350.00	\$2,905.00

Susan Sloan

7.80

\$196.15

\$1,530.00

**Expenses:**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>
-------------	--------------------	---------------

---

Photocopying

23.85

Total Expenses:

---

\$23.85

**Total Current Fees & Expenses**

---

**\$8,808.85**

**SMYSER KAPLAN & VESELKA, L.L.P.**

2300 Bank Of America Center  
700 Louisiana  
Houston, Texas 77002

Ph: (713) 221-2300 Fax: (713) 221-2320

Tax ID #76-0458372

Harris County Emergency Services District  
c/o Myrtle Cruz, Inc.  
3401 Louisiana Street, Suite 400  
Houston, Texas 77002

Nov 30, 2017

Attention: Bill Russell

File #: 117001

Inv #: 28540

RE: Grand Jury Investigation by FBI

**David Isaak**

**Net 30 Days**

Date	Initials	Description	Hrs	Amount
11/01/2017	DI	Telephone call [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; email to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; discus with [REDACTED]	0.40	\$200.00
	AMW	Teleconference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; correspondence with [REDACTED]	0.70	\$245.00
	SLS	Office conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] log; email correspondence	0.80	\$180.00
11/02/2017	DI	Call [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.70	\$350.00
	AMW	[REDACTED]; conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.80	\$280.00
	SLS	Attention to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; email correspondence [REDACTED]	4.20	\$945.00
11/03/2017	DI	[REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$150.00
	AMW	Perform document review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.80	\$630.00

	SLS	Office conference with [REDACTED]	1.10	\$247.50
11/06/2017	DI	Discuss [REDACTED] with [REDACTED]	0.30	\$150.00
	AMW	Revise [REDACTED] letter; [REDACTED]; conference with [REDACTED]	1.00	\$350.00
	SLS	[REDACTED]	2.70	\$607.50
11/07/2017	DI	Conference call with [REDACTED]	0.20	\$100.00
	AMW	[REDACTED]	0.40	\$140.00
	SLS	[REDACTED] office conferences and emails [REDACTED]	3.20	\$720.00
11/08/2017	DI	[REDACTED]	0.10	\$50.00
11/10/2017	DI	[REDACTED]	0.10	\$50.00
11/20/2017	DI	Emails [REDACTED]	0.10	\$50.00
		For Professional Services Rendered:	18.90	\$5,445.00

**File Summary:**

SKV Timekeeper	Hours	Effective Rate	Timekeeper Total
David Isaak	2.20	\$500.00	\$1,100.00
Alexander M. Wolf	4.70	\$350.00	\$1,645.00
Susan Sloan	12.00	\$225.00	\$2,700.00

**Expenses:**

Date	Description	Amount
	Photocopying	16.05
11/22/2017	Federal Express	
	Federal Express Inv#6-002-16152 - November 2017	16.97

Total Expenses:

---

\$33.02

**Total Current Fees & Expenses**

---

**\$5,478.02**

**SMYSER KAPLAN & VESELKA, L.L.P.**

2300 Bank Of America Center  
700 Louisiana  
Houston, Texas 77002

Ph: (713) 221-2300 Fax: (713) 221-2320  
Tax ID #76-0458372

Harris County Emergency Services District  
c/o Myrtle Cruz, Inc.  
3401 Louisiana Street, Suite 400  
Houston, Texas 77002

Dec 31, 2017

Attention: Bill Russell

File #: 117001

Inv #: 28777

RE: Grand Jury Investigation by FBI

**David Isaak**

**Net 30 Days**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Initials</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hrs</b>	<b>Amount</b>
12/04/2017	DI	Call with [REDACTED]	0.40	\$200.00
12/05/2017	DI	Call with [REDACTED]	0.40	\$200.00
12/20/2017	DI	Call [REDACTED]	0.40	\$200.00
12/21/2017	DI	Attend Board meeting; travel to and from same.	3.00	\$1,500.00
12/27/2017	SLS	Attention to [REDACTED] save same.	0.30	\$67.50
For Professional Services Rendered:			4.50	\$2,167.50

**File Summary:**

<b>SKV Timekeeper</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Effective Rate</b>	<b>Timekeeper Total</b>
David Isaak	4.20	\$500.00	\$2,100.00
Susan Sloan	0.30	\$225.00	\$67.50

**Total Current Fees & Expenses**

**\$2,167.50**